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ABSTRACT: Knowledge about clean and healthy life in children needs to be given early to shape 
behavior in everyday life. Knowledge about healthy living can be provided at school through various 
learning programs. This study aims to find the effectiveness of health promotion programs (JUM-
SIH) to increase children's knowledge about clean and healthy living. The research method is a pre-
experimental one-shot case study design. The respondents of this study were 68 students aged 7-8 
years. The results showed that the JUMSIH program can help children have knowledge about healthy 
living. Based on data analysis, n = 15 generally obtained scores above 2.6. It was concluded that 
healthy living skills are often performed by students such as hand washing, bathing, and toothbrush 
behavior which are basic skills for children to be able to live healthy lives. Suggestions for further 
research which is the development of various programs to increase awareness of clean and healthy 
living from an early age. 
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1 INTRODUCTION 

Education and care services have an obligation to ensure that everyone is provided with a healthy 
and safe environment for playing and working. All educators / staff are given full information 
about their responsibilities to implement and comply with health service policies and procedures. 
All children have the right to develop their full potential in an environment that provides their 
health, safety and well-being. Effective hygiene strategies and practices help services to protect 
everyone from and minimize the potential risk of communicable diseases. Experiences that pro-
mote awareness of basic hygiene help children become competent and independent and develop 
valuable life skills (Considerations & Framework, 2010).  

To be clean and healthy, ECE needs to identify what makes their services safe and sound. Educa-
tors must think about the environmental safety provided by the service, along with group and 
individual health and the wider environment outside (children, staff, parents, caregivers, and fam-
ilies) All ECEs must respond to health or safety problems or problems when they arise. Children's 
educational institutions can improve and protect health and safety by identifying, and placing 
protective measures around, problems that might or might cause problems before they occur 
(Midcentraldhb, 2014). 

Several studies were conducted to look at intervention programs in early childhood regarding 
hygiene and health. Conti, Heckman, & Pinto, (2016) research discusses the long-term impact on 
health and healthy behavior of two early childhood interventions (1) Perry's Preschool Project 
(PPP) and (2) Carolina Abecedarian Project (ABC). These results indicate the potential for early 
life interventions to improve health. Duxbury, Bradshaw, Khamanga, Tandlich, & Srinivas, 
(2019) conducts research to increase individual environmental health awareness through com-
puter-based training; education poster; interactive board game; and the take-out information leaf-
let is used for student-centered health improvement accumulation. 

Most health behaviors developed during child health promotion must begin early. Kindergarten 
has proven ideal for such interventions. Interventions and materials were developed using the 
Bartholomew Intervention Mapping approach considering Bandura's social-cognitive theory and 
Bronfenbrenner's ecological framework for human development. The results from the Kobel et 
al., (2017) study provide a better understanding of health behavior in early childhood and to iden-
tify strategies for effective health promotion. 

In the process of internalizing awareness to maintain personal and environmental health, there 
needs to be an effort to get used to maintaining health. Habitual activities safeguarding health will 
emerge when knowledge about clean and healthy life is already possessed by individuals and the 
community. So, with the knowledge possessed, it is expected that individuals and the community 
will gradually free up Clean and Healthy Behavior. Clean and Healthy Life Behavior is a reflec-
tion of family life patterns that always pay attention and maintain the health of all family members 
(Proverawati, 2012). Every family member and community consciously behaves in a way that 
reflects a clean and healthy life so that they can help themselves in their activities (Julianti, 
Nasirun, & Wembrayarli, 2018). Therefore, real efforts from various parties are needed for the 
realization of clean and healthy living habits that are entrenched in all elements, including the 
family, school and community environment. covering the family, school and community environ-
ment. 

Additional factors can influence the success of health promotion interventions in children. Ad-
verse socioeconomic status can be associated with family tensions and emotional problems in 
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children, which can lead to unhealthy habits. Consequently, underserved children tend to be very 
worried about high disease rates. Furthermore, children from low socioeconomic status are gen-
erally less affordable through lifestyle interventions, and socioeconomic status can influence the 
efficacy of health improvement programs. Nevertheless, some intervention studies target both 
lower income and richer populations to examine the feasibility of reducing or eliminating dispar-
ity. 

Schools become an important place in instilling clean and healthy behavior from an early age. 
Healthy behavior is associated with efforts to preserve, maintain and improve their health. For 
example, This behavior can be improved through the role playing method of children who can 
practice healthy behavior directly, so that it will impress deeply for children (WIjayanti, 2017). 
Based on the importance of knowledge in early childhood to maintain hygiene and health, this 
study aims to find the effectiveness of health promotion programs (JUMSIH) to improve chil-
dren's knowledge about clean and healthy living. 

2 THEORITICAL STUDY 

2.1 Health Promotion Program (JUMSIH) 

Humans as whole beings consist of physical and spiritual elements. In carrying out daily activities, 
humans must be healthy, physically healthy and spiritually healthy. Spiritual health alone is not 
enough, and vice versa. Therefore, human health is needed in life. Humans should be grateful for 
the healthy favors that God has given. With health, human productivity can increase along with 
the physical strength it has. With health, humans can work and do activities to support their lives. 
Maintaining health is an individual task and a joint task. Health is an individual duty if health is 
related to personal health. In addition, health will be a joint task of all members of the community 
when it relates to environmental health. Therefore, each person, family member, community and 
all parties need to take care of their health, both personal health and environmental health 
(Proverawati, 2012). 

Historically, health education in schools has been discussed in class using a topic approach (i.e. 
physical activity, healthy eating and mental health) while HPS offers a more holistic 'whole 
school' approach that complements the class curriculum. For example, teaching and involving 
students in gardening schools, building inclusive school food programs or incorporating physical 
activity into the classroom curriculum  (Mcisaac, Sim, Penney, & Kirk, 2012). This approach 
shifts the focus from individual student behavior to building a school environment that improves. 
As a result of shifting in emphasis, HPS requires new ways of thinking about health and the role 
of schools (WHO, 2016) 

Teachers are usually asked to provide data on early childhood education experiences in the year 
before starting school, as well as five important domains of child development upon entering 
school: physical health and well-being, social competence, emotional maturity, language and cog-
nitive skills, and communication skills and general knowledge. Goldfeld et al., (2016)’s research 
results show that engagement with preschool programs in Australia can present a reasonable, fair 
and modifiable approach to improve children's health knowledge. 

The school-promoting health aims to make schools a healthy place through a holistic approach 
that promotes a 'school ethos' that supports and emphasizes physical, social, and emotional im-
provements in welfare and educational outcomes. The development of a healthy child in turn is 
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associated with better health outcomes later in life (Mikkonen, J., Raphael, 2010). Schools offer 
the ideal set of health promotion interventions because most children spend a large part of their 
day there. Many school-based health promotion interventions have traditionally focused on 
changing individual behavior.  

The School of Health Promotion (school-promoting health, also known as the Coordinated School 
of Health or Comprehensive School of Health) is a multicomponent intervention that emphasizes 
improving educational and physical, social, and emotional outcomes. Internationally, school-pro-
moting health has been found to have a small, but positive effect on health behavior and several 
aspects of social welfare (Langford, R., Bonell, C.P., Jones, 2014). However, several studies have 
shown the effectiveness of school-promoting health in improving children's health behaviors 
(Fung, C., Kuhle, S., Lu, C., 2012). 

This framework was adapted from recommendations by the World Health Organization and fo-
cused on health coaching and learning, involving all school partners (staff, students, parents, and 
the community), providing an environment that supports health, and implementing healthy poli-
cies and practices (WHO, 2016). School-promoting health adaptation is an important feature be-
cause it ensures flexibility for a variety of school contexts across the country (Keshavarz, N., 
Nutbeam, D., Rowling, L., Khavarpour, 2010; Veugelers & Schwartz, 2010).  

School ethos reflects a variety of physical and psychosocial structures that can shape the school 
environment and, in changing, affect the health and well-being of students. Although school ethos 
is understood as an important component of school-promoting health (Samdal, O., Rowling, 
2011). The school-promoting health initiative is based on the needs and assets of each school 
community. The school board adopted the school-promoting health, setting the stage for natural 
population health experiments (Hawe, P., Potvin, 2009).  

The school has a mandate to provide education. This may include health education delivered 
through fields of study, such as science, or through special health courses and physical education. 
Students can learn effectively and can demonstrate learning facts obtained. However, encourage-
ment for students to change their behavior requires a more comprehensive approach that involves 
parents, the community and stakeholders, and includes supporting policies, programs and envi-
ronments.  

This article provides a review of school-promoting health specifically for the promotion of healthy 
eating and active living. It further provides some general understanding of the wider implemen-
tation and benefits of school-promoting health for students and schools, as well as suggestions for 
future research to increase the evidence base for public health benefits from school-promoting 
health (Veugelers & Schwartz, 2010).  Diversity within the school environment can play a rele-
vant role in the successful implementation of school and policy-based interventions. Schools vary 
greatly in terms of content, community involvement, financial support, and delivery of interven-
tions, which can influence the efficacy of childhood education programs. In addition, the charac-
teristics of teachers may be important considering that they are one of the pillars in the develop-
ment of children and play an important role for the successful implementation of school-based 
health promotion programs (Fernandez-Jimenez, Al-Kazaz, Jaslow, Carvajal, & Fuster, 2018). 

Through education, school may play a major role in promoting long-lasting healthy habits in chil-
dren, because these people spend most of their day there. Evidence shows that when healthy habits 
are adopted early in life, they are more likely to be maintained in adulthood; therefore, school-
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based interventions are considered a promising approach to shape healthy behavior from an early 
age. 

In addition, this intervention can benefit executive functioning and achievement of public schools 
in children. Many school-based interventions studies have been carried out in preschool settings; 
However, little has been tested in randomized trials. Most studies are focused primarily on pre-
venting weight gain by only discussing 1 lifestyle component, such as diet or physical activity, 
with small interventions as a whole effect size. Similar problems and overall modest effect sizes 
have been reported in a meta-analysis conducted in older children. 

2.2 Children’s Clean and Healthy Living 

Clean and healthy living behavior influenced by many factors such as habits at home, community 
environment, and in the school environment. There needs to be a continuous habituation effort so 
that clean and healthy living behavior in children can be done consciously without the need to be 
repressive to sensitize the community, such as fines when littering and so on. The habit that is 
done every day has not been able to increase children's awareness (Julianti et al., 2018). To raise 
awareness, efforts should also be made to provide knowledge about clean and healthy living. 
Habituation is one of the ways that can be carried out to carry out clean and healthy living behav-
iors.  

The habit of maintaining personal hygiene can be done with activities such as washing hands 
before eating, brushing teeth, cleansing after urinating, bathing and so on. The habit of maintain-
ing environmental cleanliness can be done through activities such as throwing trash in its place, 
limiting the use of plastic, using clean water, and so on. The habit of clean life behavior in chil-
dren, especially in early childhood can be assisted with visual aids such as pictures and infrastruc-
ture. Props in the form of pictures such as sticking pictures of how to wash hands properly and 
properly in the place of washing hands, sticking pictures throwing trash in their place in a place 
that is easily visible to children when children eat lunch, and so on.  

Facilities and infrastructure that can help children get into the habit of living a clean lifestyle such 
as a place to wash hands that are about the size of a child's body, provide a trash bin that is easily 
accessible to children when going to throw out trash and so on. Efforts to facilitate clean and 
healthy living habits in schools can be planned by the school and parents. Can also do cooperation 
and involves parents who provide healthy food every month. The teacher can design a variety of 
other creative activities to familiarize clean and healthy behavior in children. Also, efforts that 
can be made by teachers in schools that have a significant effect on children are exemplary. The 
teacher can give for example, throwing trash in its place, washing hands before eating, and so on. 

Children's behavior can be shaped through experience and interaction with their environment. 
The behavior is manifested from the results of the knowledge gained, the experiences carried out 
and interactions with the environment, both the family environment, the school environment, and 
the community environment. Behavior cannot just appear without a prior knowledge base. There-
fore, providing knowledge about the concept of a clean and healthy life is very important to do. 

Various factors can affect changes in a child's attitude, namely internal factors and external fac-
tors. Internal factors are innate in the form of a child's ability to respond to external stimuli. Be-
sides the internal factors that influence behavior are perception, motivation, and emotion. Percep-
tion is observation which is a combination of vision, hearing, smell, and experience. A similar 
object can be perceived differently by several people. Motivation is the drive to act to fulfill a 
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need while emotions are related to an individual's personality. The external factors are factors that 
exist outside of a child, for example, examples of clean and healthy living behavior that is seen 
every day in the form of throwing garbage in its place. 

Clean and healthy life behavior closely related to individual behavior in the community. Often 
encountered, the cleanliness behavior of individuals is already good, but because the community 
environment does not support so slowly the behavior that has been formed gradually eroded. 
Community behavior has not yet led to healthy behavior, especially in relation to environmental 
health and personal hygiene (Kasnodihardjo, 2010). Community behavior is less positive because 
it has not been motivated based on awareness of the importance of healthy values. The results of 
this study indicate that socialization and exemplary about PHBS still need to be carried out, for 
this reason a change agent is needed. The school environment as an educational environment is 
expected to be an agent of change in the community. So that the school environment can prepare 
students to have adequate character to conduct clean and healthy life behaviors for themselves 
and the community. 

Changes in clean and healthy living behavior can be made by referring to the assumption that the 
individual as part of the community is the subject of health services. In this case, each individual 
in the community needs to be invited to participate in identifying and discussing health problems 
as well as actively seeking alternative solutions to problems. However, with a diverse educational 
and socio-economic background, this understanding effort is less effective. Efforts to instill 
awareness of clean and healthy living behaviors in the community are effectively carried out 
among highly educated people and upper-middle economic levels. 

Health is not only the absence of disease, but also the conditions that function mentally, socially, 
physically, and spiritually. Health is an ever evolving and complex continuum which is signifi-
cantly influenced by an individual's lifestyle habits. Adopt health behavior style promotion life, 
is defined as 'all the actions and beliefs of individuals which are upheld to stay healthy and prevent 
themselves from illness', can bring about long-desired advertisements and changes in one's life. 
Healthy behavior covers a variety of domains, such as physical practice, health responsibilities, 
spiritual growth, nutrition, stress management, and interpersonal relationships. 

Health is the right of every person, not just the dominance of individuals or certain communities. 
Clean and healthy life behavior is a step that must be done to achieve optimal health for everyone. 
Healthy conditions do not necessarily occur but must always be sought from the unhealthy to a 
healthy life and create a healthy environment. This effort must start from instilling a healthy 
mindset to the community that must be started and cultivated by yourself. Efforts to optimize 
public health aim to realize the degree of public health as well as possible so that it can become 
the main capital for the development of productive and superior human resources. To familiarize 
clean and healthy living behaviors, a shared commitment is needed to support one another in 
improving the health status of the community, especially families, so that healthy development 
can be achieved optimally. 

WHO states health is one of the rights of individuals to be able to carry out all forms of activities 
or daily routines. In order to live a healthy life, everyone must be able to have good behavior, 
which is a Clean and Healthy Lifestyle. Clean and Healthy Lifestyle is a strategy used to create 
independence in creating and achieving health and is a behavior that is implemented based on 
awareness that is the result of learning that can make individuals or family members can improve 
their health in the field of public health. 
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Clean and Healthy Lifestyle one of the essences and human rights to maintain its survival. This 
is consistent with what is covered by the WHO constitution which states that a high degree of 
health is a fundamental right for individuals. This right applies to all people regardless of origin, 
religion, race, politics and economic level. This high degree of health can be obtained if everyone 
has behaviors that pay attention to health. 

The concept of behavior developed by Becker based on the concept of healthy behavior Bloom. 
Becker explained that healthy behavior is divided into three domains, namely health knowledge, 
attitude to respond to health actions (health attitude) and practice or health action (health practice). 
This domain is useful to find out how much the level of healthy behavior of each individual. 
Healthy behavior divides into the first three parts, knowledge about health, that is, what is known 
by individuals about how to improve and maintain health. Second, the attitude to respond to health 
actions, namely the individual's assessment of matters relating to how to maintain health. Third, 
practice or health action which is a direct action consisting of all activities to obtain a healthy life. 

This healthy behavior is a behavior that is used to maintain, improve health, avoid or prevent 
disease, protect themselves from various diseases, and participate in improving the quality of 
health. The improvement program is not only limited to a healthy environment and health ser-
vices, but also pay attention to behavioral factors, this is because behavioral factors can be a factor 
in the occurrence of various diseases, both infectious and non-communicable diseases (Marlina, 
2011). 

The quality of each human resource is determined by two interrelated and related factors. These 
factors consist of education and health. Health is the main requirement in obtaining the success 
of educational efforts, while education is one of the factors for achieving high health status of 
each individual (Maryunani, 2013). Clean and Healthy Lifestyle in the school environment has 
eight indicators, namely washing hands with running water and using soap, consuming healthy 
snacks in the school canteen, using clean and healthy toilet facilities, carrying out regular exercise, 
eradicating mosquito larvae at school, not smoking in the school environment, curating weight 
and height, as well as throwing away trash in the space provided. These eight indicators must be 
done well to create healthy behavior in the school environment. 

Schools are educational institutions that are targeted by PHBS, so that the application of these 
behaviors is better. This is because there is a lot of data that shows that most of the diseases that 
are often suffered by school-age children (ages 6-10) are in fact related to PHBS. In addition, the 
lack of implementation of Clean and Healthy Lifestyle in the school environment can cause other 
impacts, namely the lack of comfortable learning atmosphere due to dirty classroom environment, 
decreased student achievement and enthusiasm for learning, and can make the school's image 
worse. Therefore, it is very necessary to provide an understanding of PHBS values early on in 
school (Proverawati, 2012). 

The promotion of clean and healthy life behavior in schools can be given to three PHBS target 
groups, the primary target, secondary target, and tertiary target. The primary target in the devel-
opment of clean and healthy life behavior in schools is elementary students, where they are ex-
pected to be able to know and implement clean and healthy life behavior. Secondary targets are 
people who influence the primary goal in deciding to implement clean and healthy life behavior. 
At clean and healthy life behavior in schools, the secondary target is the teacher, where a teacher 
is a role model of the students. Tertiary targets are people who function to make formal decisions, 
such as school committees, village heads, education offices, and so on. They can provide support 



 348 

in determining policies, funding in the process of Guiding clean and healthy life behavior to be 
given to school students.  

RI Law No.36 year 2009 chapter VI article 79 Paragraph, on Health Efforts explains that efforts 
to foster health in the school environment are held with the aim of improving and developing 
healthier life skills by students. This ability must be applied in a healthy living environment, so 
that school-age children can learn, grow, develop and obtain the highest health status in order to 
become a qualified human resource. According to WHO, as many as 100,000 Indonesian children 
die from diarrheal disease each year, while data from the Ministry of Health show that of 1,000 
residents, there are 300 people who suffer from diarrhea throughout the year. 

Indonesia's Health Profile for 2009 presents data that, there are as many as 64.41% of the facilities 
that have been fostered by the environment to implement a clean and healthy life. The facilities 
consist of educational institutions as much as 67.52%, workplaces as much as 59.15%, and other 
environments as much as 62.26%. Clean and healthy life in the education setting, workplace en-
vironment, and health facility environment has not run as desired, therefore a comprehensive, 
cross-program and cross-sector approach is needed, and extraordinary resource mobilization at 
all levels government administration (Syukriyah, 2011). 

The National Basic Health Research report states that health is influenced by behaviors that up-
hold hygiene conditions. Due to the lack of attention to cleanliness, there are still many diseases 
that arise such as diarrhea, helminthiasis, filariasis, dengue fever, and vomiting. Hygiene prob-
lems that are still mostly experienced by elementary school students, namely problems with teeth 
as much as 86%, can't cut nails as much as 53%, can't brush teeth as much as 42% and don't wash 
their hands before eating as much as 8%. While the diseases that are mostly suffered by elemen-
tary school students are intestinal worms of 60-80%, and dental caries as much as 74.4%. There-
fore, to overcome this problem, it is necessary to have comprehensive efforts from various sectors. 

The school environment as an educational environment is a very strategic environment to provide 
knowledge and instill habituation about clean and healthy living. Learners will more easily follow 
the rules that apply in schools. So that schools can make various activities that are integrated with 
learning activities programs. The activity program can be a general program that is applied to all 
students in the school or a class program specifically created by the class teacher together with 
his students. General programs that can be carried out in schools can be in the form of health 
promotion programs and carried out simultaneously by all students. Health promotion activities 
have been carried out by SD Lab school, Jakarta State University, in the form of Clean Friday 
activities, commonly abbreviated as JUMSIH. 

JUMSIH activities are carried out every Friday and involve all students in the school. The children 
are divided into groups and given tasks by the division of labor, the division of labor includes 
sweeping and mopping the class floor, cleaning the classroom glass, sweeping the yard, cleaning 
the fishpond, cleaning the bathroom, and so on. The division of work takes turns divided into 
different groups so that each child can feel the different tasks in each JUMSIH activity. 

In the JUMSIH activity, the children are actively involved and work together in groups. JUMSIH 
is a health promotion activity designed by the school and involves all school residents. The ob-
jective of JUMSIH is to familiarize clean and healthy living behavior in the school environment 
and is expected to form a clean and healthy character of each student. 
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3 METHODS 

3.1 Partisipant 

This research was conducted in elementary schools in Jakarta. The sampling technique uses pur-
posive sampling technique that is the sampling technique with specific considerations and objec-
tives (Creswell, 2012). In this study aims to determine the clean and healthy life promotion pro-
gram conducted at school. Schools that fulfill this research objective are SD LabSchool, Jakarta 
State University. The sample of this study were 68 students including all grade 3 students at SD 
Labschool, Universitas Negeri Jakarta. 

3.2 Research Design 

This study uses a pre-experimental design with one-shot case study. In research that uses this 
design, it is only done in one group. After treatment, post-test is immediately carried out on the 
sample (Gall, Gall, & Borg, 2007). The design of this study uses a treatment in the form of a 
Jumsih program which is a clean and healthy life promotion program implemented at SD Lab-
School. The research design is illustrated in the following table 1 below: 

Table 1. Research Design Experiment 

X O 
Treatment of JUMSIH Posttest of healthy and Clean Knowledge 

3.3 Instrument 

This research instrument has passed the instrument validity test and expert test related to 
knowledge about clean and healthy life for early childhood. This instrument is used to be an in-
dicator of test questions given to respondents (see table 2). 

Table 2. Clean and Healthy Living Knowledge 

NO PERTANYAAN 

1 Benefits of washing hands 
2 Diseases arising from not washing hands 
3 When to wash your hands 
5 Dangerous snack at random 
6 What you need to keep in mind when buying food 
7 Why urinate and defecate must be in the toilet 
8 Here are the main objectives of sport 
9 Mosquito bites can cause diseases, among others 
10 How to eradicate mosquito larvae 
11 Weighing your weight and measuring height is done regularly every time 
12 The benefits of weighing and measuring height are carried out regularly, among     

     others 
13 Weight and height results 
14 Garbage is a nest 
15 Types of waste 
16 The following is an example of dry waste 
17 B3 waste is what garbage 
18 How to manage rubbish bins, among others 
19 How to maintain environmental health from rubbish 
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20 Why do you have to do Clean and Healthy Living (JUMSIH) 

3.4 Procedures 

The research was carried out during August 2019. Research procedures include the preparation, 
implementation and evaluation stages. In the preparation phase, the researcher visits the school 
where the research is carried out. This preparation stage includes, (1) determining the research 
sample; (2) observation of research sites; (3) initial observation of the research sample; (4) 
Teacher interviews about the JUMSIH program; and (5) Designing a post-test schedule. 

At the research implementation stage, they included (1) observations of the implementation of the 
JUMSIH program 3 times Friday; (2) Interview of respondents during the implementation of 
JUMSIH; and (3) Post-test implementation to find out students' knowledge about clean and 
healthy living knowledge. At the evaluation stage, the researcher conducts a final review of the 
activities of the sample and a final interview with the teacher about student knowledge. 

Implementation refers to material learning plans to find out students' knowledge about clean and 
healthy living. The implementation consists of three stages, namely introduction, core activities, 
and closing. This activity consists of exploration, elaboration, and confirmation. Observations 
made by researchers to find and obtain data about everything that happens and observe or record 
changes in student learning outcomes during the learning process takes place as a benchmark for 
the success of the JUMSIH program towards students' knowledge about clean and healthy living. 
In this research procedure, the researcher collaborates with the classroom teacher. 

2.1. Data Analysis 

Data analysis in the study used score measurements obtained by the sample at the time of the 
post-test. The sample conducts tests to measure knowledge about clean and healthy living. The 
questions given contained material that was diseased with knowledge of clean and healthy living. 
The value obtained by students is calculated based on the provisions, if correct get a score of 1, 
and if one gets a value of 0. The score is added up and becomes the final score obtained by stu-
dents.  

4 RESULTS AND DISCUSSION 

The results of this study indicate the results of tests on clean and healthy living knowledge, the 
following data are obtained: as many as 5 students (7.4%) who answered correctly one clean 
living knowledge problem, 8 students (11.8)% who answered two to three questions, 16 students 
(23.5%) who answered correctly 4 to 5 questions, as many as 8 students (11.8)% who answered 
correctly 6 to 7 questions, as many as 13 students (19)% who answered correctly 8 to 9 questions, 
there are 7 students (10.3)% who answered correctly 10 to 11 questions, and 11 students (16.2)% 
who answered correctly 12 to 13 questions. Briefly can be seen in the table and histogram below. 
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Figure 1. The Results of Tests on Clean and Healthy Living Knowledge 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Figure 2. The Histogram Results of Tests on Clean and Healthy Living Knowledge 

Based on the histogram above, it can be concluded that students' healthy living skills can be cat-
egorized as good. Based on statements which amounted to 15 generally obtained a score of 2.6 
and above. It is concluded that healthy living skills are carried out frequently by students. The 
behavior of washing hands, bathing, toothbrushes which are basic skills for children to be able to 
live a healthy life have been done by students. 

The JUMSIH program as a clean and healthy life promotion program carried out at Lab-School, 
Jakarta State University, influences students' knowledge about clean and healthy living. The 
JUMSIH program has proven effective in helping students understand the concepts of clean and 
healthy living. Like previous research, there is effectiveness through the intervention of health 
promotion programs in schools in fostering healthy behavior in terms of improvement in healthy 
eating and active living (McIsaac et al., 2017). School can change the environment and students 
present reported an increase in fruit and vegetable consumption along with a decrease in energy 
intake, were more physically active, and showed less obesity compared to students elsewhere. 

Schools that have a clean and healthy life promotion program will greatly assist students in gain-
ing knowledge specifically about understanding and behavior about clean and healthy living. The 
school provides an excellent opportunity to enable students to acquire knowledge and skills and 
increase the level of activity there is early childhood because children and adolescents should 
ideally spend significant time in their young lives there and educational efforts can be carried out 
regularly and continuously. There is plenty of evidence to support the effectiveness of school-
based health care which is done with good promotional interventions to increase physical activity 
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among students. The school environment has a significant impact on sustainable healthy behavior, 
a key factor in the success of the School of Health Promotion. 

The multidimensional approach does not only focus on curriculum-based interventions but also 
includes policy-based strategies, environmental change, community and parent participation, sup-
plementary school food programs etc. in order to provide opportunities to increase physical ac-
tivity in a structured and unstructured way (WHO, 2016). Schools can change students' lifestyles 
that are continually conveying knowledge and skills, as well as influencing values and attitudes. 

From this research, it was found that the JUMSIH program could encourage students to cooperate. 
Because in the implementation of JUMSIH, students collaborate. For example, some children are 
in charge of sweeping the floor, some sweep the yard, clean the bathroom, clean the pool, and so 
on. In cooperative learning, the teacher is considered to only create a teaching and learning envi-
ronment and process. Thus, the teacher must design activities that create learning environments 
that facilitate students to work together (Akçay, 2016; Manning, M. L., & Lucking, 1991).  

Also, the JUMSIH program can train children to be responsible for their work. Children who have 
the task of sweeping the floor must be responsible for sweeping and making the classroom clean. 
Through the JUMSIH program, students enjoy and feel happy because students assume that the 
implementation of JUMSIH is like refreshing from daily routine activities in class. This is very 
good for the development and learning process of children and will provide space for children to 
express themselves through fun activities. JUMSIH program is also an activity that can train chil-
dren to move their bodies through movement activities such as sweeping, mopping, and so on.  

Children's knowledge about clean living can be obtained through family education at home. Pa-
rental involvement in providing knowledge about clean and healthy living can make children 
understand about the concept. The involvement of fathers is very influential to increase children's 
understanding of the concept of healthy living (Allport et al., 2018). However, schools also have 
a very important role to provide students with a habit of living a clean life through health promo-
tion programs, for example the JUMSIH program implemented at SD Lab-School, State Univer-
sity of Jakarta.  

Health programs in schools that need to be introduced include a variety of things, one of which is 
about children's sleeping knowledge as a part that is inseparable from clean and healthy living 
behavior. One of the materials for a good sleeping health program and other intervention for chil-
dren is the responsibility of parents and teachers (Bonuck, Schwartz, & Schechter, 2016; 
McClure, Tarr, Thompson, & Eckhoff, 2017). The JUMSIH program only focuses on self-pro-
motion programs and the school environment in the form of carrying out activities to clean up the 
school environment so as to create a clean school environment and children in the school grow 
healthy. 

5 CONCLUSION 

The results of the study concluded that the JUMSIH program as a school health promotion 
program which is routinely carried out every Friday effectively to increase students' knowledge 
about healthy living. This was known from the results of tests conducted in this study. JUMSIH 
activities that are carried out through hands-on practice make students know about healthy living. 
Also, students can apply hygiene activities in their daily lives. So hopefully the JUMSIH program 
can make students have a clean and healthy life behavior. The implication of this research is to 
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provide direction for schools to make various health promotion programs for children. With 
variations in health programs, children are expected to understand more about personal hygiene 
and health and their environment. 
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